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This book is a collection of four famous novels by Charles Dickens: ‘A Tale of Two Cities’, ‘Great
Expectations’, ‘A Christmas Carol’ and ‘David Copperfield’. This unique edition includes unique
annotations. In addition, a set of illustrations helps the reader to visualise the period of the author’s life.

Charles Dickens was born in 1812 and died in 1870. He left a legacy of magnificent novels that are still very
popular with readers.

John Leech, born 1817, died 1864, was English caricaturist and illustrator. He created a set of illustrations to
the first edition of ‘A Christmas Carol’.

‘A Tale of Two Cities’ by Charles Dickens – a timeless literary masterpiece of the Victorian era – has
captivated millions of hearts and minds of readers for a century and a half all over the world.

Peerless depiction of French Revolution as a backdrop for a thrilling plot. This novel continues to be hugely
popular with audiences even today.

This unique edition includes author’s biography, genesis of the novel, with historical context, specifically
written for this book, along with contemporary critique as well as carefully selected illustrations and links to
wealth of resources on Charles Dickens and his novel.

‘Great Expectations’ by Charles Dickens – a timeless literary masterpiece of the Victorian era – has
captivated millions of hearts and minds of readers for a century and a half all over the world.

Dickens himself considered Great Expectations to be his best work of art. The plot is set in between 1812
and 1840 in Kent and London, and is full of action, suspense, unexpected twists and extreme imagery. This
novel continues to be hugely popular with audiences even today.

This unique edition includes dedicated author’s biography. In addition, you will enjoy additional
introductory text giving you background on the novel. These include synopsis and genesis of the novel,
historical context and contemporary critique, all of which have been specifically written for Dickens’ ‘Great
Expectations’ and you will not find them anywhere else. Moreover, a set of carefully selected illustrations
and links to wealth of resources on Charles Dickens and his masterpiece is included.

‘A Christmas Carol’ by Charles Dickens – a timeless literary masterpiece of the Victorian era – has
captivated millions of hearts and minds of readers for a century and a half all over the world.



This unique edition includes dedicated author’s biography, historical context, little knows facts, significance
of the novel, its legacy as well as a set of original illustrations by John Leech.

‘A Christmas Carol’ was published in 1843. This is a tale of miserly and bitter Ebenezer Scrooge’s
transformation on a number of levels – emotional, ethical and ideological. The transformation is caused by
various ghosts visiting Scrooge, Marley Ghosts and Ghosts of Previous, Present and Future Christmas.
The novella became very popular immediately. Voices of the critics were also favourable.

Dickens’ ‘A Christmas Carol’ changed Christmas for ever, promoting family gatherings, charitable giving
and merriment.

‘David Copperfield’ by Charles Dickens – a timeless literary masterpiece of the Victorian era – has
captivated millions of hearts and minds of readers for a century and a half all over the world.

This unique edition includes dedicated author’s biography, novel synopsis, historical context, little knows
facts, character list and contemporary critique.

David was born half-orphan, as his father died before his birth. His mother re-marries, but new family does
not bring happiness for David. The plot unfolds, David rents a room at a house of Mr Wickfield who lives
with his daughter Agnes, who becomes David’s friend. Soon, David meets Dora and the story gets
complicated. Few more characters are vital for the plot, but … you need to find it out yourself!

David Copperfield was first published in instalments in 1849-1850, full version followed in 1858.
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From reader reviews:

Phillip Permenter:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject A TALE OF
TWO CITIES, GREAT EXPECTATIONS, A CHRISTMAS CAROL and DAVID COPPERFIELD - FOUR
NOVELS BY CHARLES DICKENS (annotated, illustrated) suitable to you? The book was written by well-
known writer in this era. The actual book untitled A TALE OF TWO CITIES, GREAT EXPECTATIONS, A
CHRISTMAS CAROL and DAVID COPPERFIELD - FOUR NOVELS BY CHARLES DICKENS
(annotated, illustrated)is the main one of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a
number of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever
know just before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily
to know the core of this book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now.
To help you see the represented of the world with this book.

Cameron Rodriquez:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
A TALE OF TWO CITIES, GREAT EXPECTATIONS, A CHRISTMAS CAROL and DAVID
COPPERFIELD - FOUR NOVELS BY CHARLES DICKENS (annotated, illustrated) your brain will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely will end up
your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a e-book then become one web form conclusion and
explanation in which maybe you never get ahead of. The A TALE OF TWO CITIES, GREAT
EXPECTATIONS, A CHRISTMAS CAROL and DAVID COPPERFIELD - FOUR NOVELS BY
CHARLES DICKENS (annotated, illustrated) giving you an additional experience more than blown away
your head but also giving you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us show you
the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it,
like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Gary Carter:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer might be A TALE OF TWO CITIES, GREAT
EXPECTATIONS, A CHRISTMAS CAROL and DAVID COPPERFIELD - FOUR NOVELS BY
CHARLES DICKENS (annotated, illustrated) why because the wonderful cover that make you consider in
regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the
outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.



Peter Landon:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It
is called of book A TALE OF TWO CITIES, GREAT EXPECTATIONS, A CHRISTMAS CAROL and
DAVID COPPERFIELD - FOUR NOVELS BY CHARLES DICKENS (annotated, illustrated). You can
include your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you
happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one location to
other place.
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