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Nineteen-year-old Harold Chasen is obsessed with death. He fakes suicides to shock his self-obsessed
mother, drives a customized Jaguar hearse, and attends funerals of complete strangers. Seventy-nine-year-old
Maude Chardin, on the other hand, adores life. She liberates trees from city sidewalks and transplants them
to the forest, paints smiles on the faces of church statues, and “borrows” cars to remind their owners that life
is fleeting—here today, gone tomorrow! A chance meeting between the two turns into a madcap, whirlwind
romance, and Harold learns that life is worth living. Harold and Maude started as Colin Higgins’ master’s
thesis at UCLA Film School, and the script was purchased by Paramount. The film, directed by Hal Ashby,
was released in 1971 and it bombed. But soon this quirky, dark comedy began being shown on college
campuses and at midnight-movie theaters, and it gained a loyal cult following. This novelization was written
by Higgins and published shortly after the film’s release but has been out of print for more than 30 years.
Even fans who have seen the movie dozens of times will find this companion valuable, as it gives fresh
elements to watch for and answers many of the film’s unresolved questions.
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From reader reviews:

Angeline Stallings:

This book untitled Harold and Maude to be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is
because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this kind of book
in the book retailer or you can order it by way of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no
reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Bruce Crawford:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with
may doesn't work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Harold and Maude why because the great cover that make
you consider about the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic as
the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Willie Isaac:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can see
that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to you is
Harold and Maude this reserve consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer value to explain it is
easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this
book ideal all of you.

Wendy Kroll:

You will get this Harold and Maude by look at the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it can to
be your solve challenge if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only
simply by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era like now,
you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to
get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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