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Discover 307 awesome money-making strategies that work!

This revolutionary book has 20 informative, inspirational, irreverent chapters to help women business
owners be more successful. Whether you are a female entrepreneur, a professional woman climbing the
corporate ladder, or a woman (or man!) dreaming of starting your own company, you've got to have this
book. Gutsy ideas for femme fatales, grande dames, and wonder women abound here. The material covers
everything from generating free publicity (then truly profiting from it) to advertising on the cheap from
forming strategic alliances to capitalizing on nontraditional sales channels. Women Business Owners Wage a
Revolution

Sassy lasses are starting new companies at twice the rate of macho males. This isn't a fad. It isn't a trend. It's
a revolution. According to statistics released by the Business Women's Network, it's estimated that by 2005,
fully 50 percent of all American businesses will be owned by women, thus significantly increasing the
growth rate of new enterprises. This is a gender bender of huge proportions and far-reaching ramifications.

"These entrepreneurial women will change the face of business," predicts Marilyn Ross, author of the new
book Shameless Marketing for Brazen HussiesTM. "Woman is blessed with a nurturing nature. We're
intuitive, good listeners, and well organized. Plus we think holistically, are as tenacious as pit bulls, and can
use our sensuality as a powerful agent for change in the marketplace."

Ross contends that as stewards of their own talents and gifts, women are possibility thinkers. To fully
succeed in today's competitive and complicated business environment they must be clever. Gutsy. Dedicated.
Technologically savvy. Service oriented. "We can have just as much 'juice' as the guys and play hardball to
the max," she says. "We just do it differently."

Shameless Marketing for Brazen HussiesTM: 307 Awesome Money-Making Strategies for Savvy
Entrepreneurs has 16 informative, inspirational, irreverent chapters to help female entrepreneurs kick butt.
The material covers everything from generating free publicity (then truly capitalizing on it) to advertising on
the cheap from forming strategic alliances to unveiling nontraditional sales channels. Dozens of helpful Web
sites put this guide on the cutting edge, and personal stories of successful female entrepreneurs encourage as
they edify. The book shows women how to be risk takers. Rule breakers. Rainmakers.

As of 1999, there were 9.1 million women-owned businesses in the U.S. employing over 27.5 million people
and generating $3.6 trillion in sales. Yet women traditionally make less in their ventures than do men. Ross
is out to change that. "We must develop a marketing mind-set that capitalizes on our feminity; one that
allows estrogen and entrepreneurship to mix and create excellence." This book points the way.
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From reader reviews:

Randy Anderson:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or even goal; it means that guide
has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, person feel need book when they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making
Strategies for Savvy Entrepreneurs.

Betty Smith:

The book Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making Strategies for Savvy
Entrepreneurs can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
So just why must we leave a good thing like a book Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome
Money-Making Strategies for Savvy Entrepreneurs? A number of you have a different opinion about reserve.
But one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together
with your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; you may share
all of these. Book Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making Strategies for
Savvy Entrepreneurs has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can
seem the enormous world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Kim Adams:

The book untitled Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making Strategies for
Savvy Entrepreneurs is the guide that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the book
content that will be shown to an individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure the
information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Shameless
Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making Strategies for Savvy Entrepreneurs from the
publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Johnny Sutton:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to your account is Shameless Marketing for Brazen Hussies: 307 Awesome Money-Making
Strategies for Savvy Entrepreneurs this guide consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world



now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer
require to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.
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