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Mary Hampton argues that a set of ideas that influenced American policymakers in the postwar era help
explain the unique evolution of the Western Alliance and Germany's rapid unification in 1990. These ideas,
called the Wilsonian impulse, derived from the historical lessons concerning World War I and the interwar
years learned by prominent American policymakers. The most important lesson was that a trans-Atlantic
community of nations must be built that included a democratic and equal Germany. West German leaders
were persistent in appealing to the Wilsonian impulse to promote their national interests. In particular, Bonn
was able to ensure over time Washington's pledge to aid in the peaceful unification of Germany. The success
of that policy became evident in 1990.

Recent works in international relations theory have explored the impact of ideas on international institutions
and on the foreign policymaking process. This study contributes to that literature by examining the role ideas
have had on the evolution of Western relations in the postwar era. Hampton focuses on the cluster of ideas
she calls the Wilsonian impulse. Derived from the historical lessons drawn from World War I and the
interwar years, these distinctly Wilsonian ideas largely constructed the beliefs that American foreign
policymakers held about trans-Atlantic relations in the immediate postwar period. Central was the belief that
the European balance of power system must be superceded by a Western community of nations wherein a
democratic Germany would be included on an equal basis.

Hampton examines how the influence of the Wilsonian impulse permitted West German leaders to gain rapid
entrance into the Western Alliance on favorable terms. More importantly, the U.S. led the West in sharing
responsibility for the eventual unification of Germany as part of the Allied pledge of support for Bonn. The
peaceful unification of Germany in 1990 brought to fruition the future envisioned by the Wilsonian impulse.
This book will be of interest to scholars and researchers of 20th century American foreign policy and modern
German history.
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From reader reviews:

Judith Robinson:

This The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S. Foreign Policy, the Alliance, and German Unification book is not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is usually
information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper an individual read
a lot of information you will get. This specific The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S. Foreign Policy, the Alliance,
and German Unification without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in contemplating
and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S. Foreign Policy, the Alliance, and
German Unification can bring when you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn out to be
full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S.
Foreign Policy, the Alliance, and German Unification having great arrangement in word and layout, so you
will not sense uninterested in reading.

Clarence Bowen:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you have
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S. Foreign Policy, the
Alliance, and German Unification as the daily resource information.

Milan Allen:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline The Wilsonian
Impulse: U.S. Foreign Policy, the Alliance, and German Unification suitable to you? The particular book was
written by famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S. Foreign
Policy, the Alliance, and German Unificationis one of several books in which everyone read now. This book
was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that
you ever know ahead of. The author explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can
easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world
now. To help you see the represented of the world within this book.

Tara Payton:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are
more valuable than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that.
What you are related is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books.
One of several books in the top collection in your reading list is definitely The Wilsonian Impulse: U.S.



Foreign Policy, the Alliance, and German Unification. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides
can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this publication you can get
many advantages.
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