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“The most we can hope for is that we are paraphrased correctly.” In this statement, Lenore Keeshig-Tobias
underscores one of the main issues in the representation of Aboriginal peoples by non-Aboriginals. Non-
Aboriginal people often fail to understand the sheer diversity, multiplicity, and shifting identities of
Aboriginal people. As a result, Aboriginal people are often taken out of their own contexts.

Walking a Tightrope plays an important role in the dynamic historical process of ongoing change in the
representation of Aboriginal peoples. It locates and examines the multiplicity and distinctiveness of
Aboriginal voices and their representations, both as they portray themselves and as others have characterized
them. In addition to exploring perspectives and approaches to the representation of Aboriginal peoples, it
also looks at Native notions of time (history), land, cultures, identities, and literacies. Until these are
understood by non-Aboriginals, Aboriginal people will continue to be misrepresented—both as individuals
and as groups.

By acknowledging the complex and unique legal and historical status of Aboriginal peoples, we can begin to
understand the culture of Native peoples in North America. Until then, given the strength of stereotypes,
Native people have come to expect no better representation than a paraphrase.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Young:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great and also important the book Walking a Tightrope: Aboriginal
People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies). All type of book could you see on many options.
You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

James Sanchez:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book Walking a Tightrope: Aboriginal People and
Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) seemed to be making you to know about other understanding and
of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The publication Walking a
Tightrope: Aboriginal People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) is not only giving you more
new information but also to become your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend
time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with the book Walking a Tightrope: Aboriginal People
and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies). You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read
some books.

Corinna Edwards:

This Walking a Tightrope: Aboriginal People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) usually are
reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The explanation of this Walking a Tightrope:
Aboriginal People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) can be one of several great books you
must have is usually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed a person with information that
might be will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you
go and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed people. Beside that this Walking a Tightrope:
Aboriginal People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) giving you an enormous of experience
including rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime.
So , let's have it appreciate reading.

April Brooks:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Walking a Tightrope:
Aboriginal People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) that give your entertainment preference
will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for
people to know world better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly



that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for
every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you may pick Walking a Tightrope: Aboriginal
People and Their Representations (Indigenous Studies) become your own starter.
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