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Tributes is a collection of poetry and song lyrics honoring those who inspired the tracks or pieces. While
some artists have moved on, I remember them. They taught me how to write a variety of things but
especially music. You'll see mention of greats like Parliament Funkadelic, Luther Vandross, Gerald LeVert
and others. This collection will take you back in time when you first heard their music and experiencing life
in younger days. Well this generation along with the future deserves a new spin on the greats. This is my
attempt at making great music. It reads like poetry. There are many volumes to both Tributes and its
companion series Sequels. We are taking the time to release them properly. It is intended for these songs to
be recorded by myself and others. Those not containing explicit language since I'm at a new point in my life
where I try not to express myself that way in written or creative form. Please pray for me that it continues.
Tributes gives homage to all those who have helped inspire me creatively. I hope you enjoy as I have
enjoyed writing these pieces. JHillExecutive@yahoo.com 404-980-8880 phone/voice mail 678-817-1319 fax
https://www.facebook.com/Real-Game-University-Publishing-1743553489219388/
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From reader reviews:

Darrell Fowler:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled Tributes: Pay
Day's Poetry & Music (Amazon Version): Compiled Volumes 1-4? Maybe it is to get best activity for you.
You know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you
agree with it is opinion or you have different opinion?

Gena Colgan:

Book is usually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book Tributes: Pay Day's Poetry & Music
(Amazon Version): Compiled Volumes 1-4 will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading a book
make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find
best book or acceptable book with you?

Lonnie Fazio:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of
you maybe will probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Tributes: Pay Day's Poetry &
Music (Amazon Version): Compiled Volumes 1-4 is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Ellen McNulty:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You
can choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred
to as of book Tributes: Pay Day's Poetry & Music (Amazon Version): Compiled Volumes 1-4. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual
happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to
other place.
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