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To mark the 150th anniversary of Debussy's birth in 2012, Henle is proud to present a tribute to his piano
solo works in three volumes, available as a paperbound or a clothbound edition. As a publishing house
whose main focus is on piano music, it was important for Henle to give a special place to the works of
Claude Debussy, the innovator of piano style. Thus since the early 1980s they have steadily been publishing
single editions of all of Debussy's important works for the piano. Their editor Ernst-Günter Heinemann has
worked closely with the French Debussy scholar François Lesure to present Debussy's elaborate music in
high quality Urtext editions. Beginning with the "Danse bohémienne" from 1880, all of the single works
from their catalog have been drawn together in these three volumes, arranged according to their date of
composition. And as a little "encore" we have included the Prélude to the cantata "La Damoiselle élue" in
volume I. Each of the three volumes contains true highlights for the piano. But the short and lesser known
works also offer a glimpse at the modern classical composer Debussy from a different angle. In addition each
volume contains a helpful glossary with all of Debussy's often very vivid performance instructions translated
into English and German. Bon anniversaire, Claude Debussy!
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From reader reviews:

Kerry Erdman:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I
Henle 1192 (1192). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know
about how is important some sort of book Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192
(1192). You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right,
mainly because from book you can know everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you
will be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we could
open a book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up
to go to the library. Let's go through.

Donald Chen:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
this specific aren't like that. This Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192 (1192)
book is readable by simply you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the information here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want
to deliver to you. The writer involving Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192
(1192) content conveys the thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not
different in the articles but it just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Debussy Piano
Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192 (1192) is not loveable to be your top record reading
book?

Michael Santiago:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read the book.
It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a book. The book Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192 (1192) it doesn't
matter what good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the
particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to cover
but this book possesses high quality.

Pilar Porter:

This Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192 (1192) is great guide for you because
the content and that is full of information for you who have always deal with world and also have to make
decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it info accurately using great arrange word or we can state



no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean
it only provides you with straight forward sentences but challenging core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having Debussy Piano Works Volume I Klavierwerke Band I Henle 1192 (1192) in your hand
like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no guide that
offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this guide already do that. So , this is certainly
good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?
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