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Once again, New York Times bestselling author Carla Neggers masters the nonstop suspense and pulse-
pounding romance that keep her millions of readers up all night.
Vermont newspaper editor Cozie Hawthorne is astounded by the money she makes when her collection of
Yankee essays becomes a bestseller. But that doesn't mean she'll let success go to her head: she still drives a
rusted Jeep and lives in a house -- built in 1790 -- that seems more amenable to bats than it does interesting
men.
Daniel Foxworth, renegade son of the Texas oil Foxworths, specializes in putting out chemical fires. At least
he did until someone sabotaged his helicopter and almost killed him. The prime suspect is Cozie's brother,
Seth, and evidence is piling up as fast as attraction is growing between Daniel and Cozie. When she finds out
that the sexy Texan is out to prove her brother's guilt, Cozie is determined to find out who's really after
Daniel. But as danger mounts, Daniel faces an even greater challenge: winning Cozie's trust...before
someone ends up dead.
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From reader reviews:

Lynn Gowen:

The experience that you get from Finding You will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide
inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Finding You giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this e-book is
well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand
then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this specific
Finding You instantly.

Agnes Figueroa:

Finding You can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away
because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into joy
arrangement in writing Finding You however doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and
also based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one among it. This great information could drawn
you into brand-new stage of crucial considering.

Eddie McCoy:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but in addition novel and Finding You or even others sources were given
know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more.
Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those publications are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes Finding You to
make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Jean Taylor:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. So you know that
little person like reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your personal
teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by book. Numerous books
that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Finding You.
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