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Young Teddie Crawford is dead from multiple stab wounds in a restaurant kitchen awash with blood. LAPD
homicide detective Kate Delafield is relentless in her pursuit and capture of his killer. But bringing that killer
to trial imperils Kate’s professional standing and personal privacy—and her belief in the justice system to
which she has devoted her life.

The suspect claims self-defense—that Teddie Crawford made a homosexual advance and backed it up with a
knife. Yet everything Kate learns about Teddie Crawford tells her that his murder was deliberate. And to
develop proof of first degree murder, she must find clear answers to mystifying questions for the prosecuting
attorney—a woman who has never before prosecuted a homicide case.

Kate is increasingly isolated as she tries to shield her young lover from the brutal realities of this case and
finds few allies among her LAPD brethren. Even her partner, Ed Taylor, is loathe to aggressively pursue a
case involving a dead gay man and his gay associates. As the trial date looms, she discovers she has a
personal stake: the defense attorney is a man from her past. A man with the power to expose the private life
she has kept rigidly separate from her life as a police officer.

Murder by Tradition reaches new heights in the powerful storytelling readers have come to expect from
Katherine V. Forrest. Lambda Literary Award Winner.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Vinci:

The book Murder by Tradition gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to
make your capable more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting tension or having big
problem together with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Murder by Tradition to become
your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about some or
all subjects. You may know everything if you like open up and read a publication Murder by Tradition.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you
think about this book?

Richard Perkins:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Murder by Tradition book because
this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred per cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it as you know.

Carol Shull:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Murder
by Tradition suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. Often the book
untitled Murder by Traditionis the main of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a
number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new shape that you ever
know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to
comprehend the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So that
you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Sandra Bland:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book
entitled Murder by Tradition your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
single aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every
word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never
get prior to. The Murder by Tradition giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head
but also giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a
sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?
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